15 @I, 1937 (21°)

TET 791 T, YhaR
6 dgFY, 2015 (30)

16 37aER, 2015
HEAT-TA0SN0-36/2015-123/510-- SIRES AU Asad &l AFdfar@d e 59

W IIUT T&eieh 13 3ercer, 2015 Pl HJATT & Yeb © 3Hb GRI FAATIROT T FaeT o forw
eI fopam ST &

SIRES 3cUre (EMye) T, 2015
(EREs A, 15, 2015)

FIRWUS TIGR gRT AT FEA1-1306 A 14 FadeR, 2002 gRT 3i9fipa ReR va 38ar 3curg
fafATH, 1915 (FR@Us AATAIH |1, 1915) B FREUS ToT FH AR Td Yo el & o FMae
g IRfETa|

UEATEAT - Toied HAIGel & 36T A, U & T GeAUR T ARG & HIY IrHael H UHAHA &
for sIR@us 3cure AfAATH & FAT gusdy WAt & for HAWT Ut B 3Gy
HAT IAIE ¢ WA & UAT A, 1996 P URT-4 (m) & HJFU 3curg IfdfETa



2 FRWUS ISl (IMTIROT) LEhAR, 6 AddR, 2015

AU AT W F@HET @ IR | A b & el A AIAE vd 3efipd adA
R@US 3cUrE MAIH, 1915 (3IR@Us JfAATT |1, 1915) & FfAug uraurar d g
&I ITARIRAT Tl BT grau=r F GAGA g IfAfATH;

1. qieT a1, AR v 3RFH -
() I% JIAEIH FIREUs 3cure (@Ayad) AT, 2015 FEr o T
(2) sFH AEIR IOt FIR@US AT A M|
(B) TE TAHT Teic F ypRF H AT T uga gem

2. FRAPTT A GRT 47 F T FH T3 9 & ufarAuar - FREAIH Hir Qg arr 47 F
T 7 RAfaf@a a8 arr ufaeafa fr smef, gar -

"47. TR feg 3mag, Aaa, uRaea, RARHAT, e, 3umer, OB scafe & T gus:-
e P s su 3RPIA 3var 37 INRFIF F 30T 99 Fh B T [oeeh 73 oFd
FRgEar o1 G v TR 3meer svar 3@ ARATE & 39T § T Hgefd, WA a1 uRS F
Soolded H —

(®) TR ACE gog o g, AT, aRaed, AfaaTor, wear, suser ar g &Y 3yar

@) [T & gdieary Ry AT @ Aidede HY; 3rYar

@) DS 3Eae, AfSAORrer, Farder (3R I HUSEIR TG & T Iad; JUar

@ AN 3UANT ¥ UTas TG arsr & e feEr o Aee ged o fAfador e & fow
S T, FAPR (Feer), e, JUHIOT AT JIAT BT T o, IW AT Peol A IW; 3Hyar

() TS & AR Tl St 3rYar 3T [hEl ToT & PRI &9 b AT = e fhed,
YQT 37UAT 31T BIS AN FFH AGh g Uh fhAT ST TP AT AlGh g B Ueb dled b JATIATY
VIT P T, SUROT A7 AMT 30 peat F T 37T

(@ 8 IREIA & 3T T, TG, UAHd AT Aref fhdl 3mHae], Jaraaer ar
HUSTIR AT HUSRUT & Rl 3T TAH A PS AlcHh ged e,

dr g8 W8 SREE ¥ fSEd At ©: A ¥ wA 6 e, Saer [Edr e auf g6 @
Fha 3N da JAH F FHDT THA UMT TN T § A A& N Afhad [Sae fEdR e org
TIY T B Fhell, ¥ gosd fhar SR 3R AT T & f g A 0 3fARS dREama d Srah
Hafd b a¥ e o Hehdll, afUsd fhar SdeT |




SRYUS ITSIC (ATIRYT) YhdR, 6 ddFeR, 2015 3

3. AT A AT arT 49 & TUF #H a8 9RT 1 ufaeyma - yRPgE & Qgeme g/
49 & T H Arafafla a8 g gfavafa & seh, gar -

"49. TRl Rpa 3@ @ uRafia o dgds yara & fav gug - St A% o R fapa
3raa P fREr off ad & 59 FfAUT & gRafdad & a1 aRakid & & . & [F g 3maa
foreT off Tk @ AT 3uHT H I3, I 9€ UT TT A & I @i i IS & Tq FA a1 =g foeT
Y aIh F YT 3T deol A VAT T o F@P aR FH a8 JGd1 & I¥ar 39 T Fa @
FRUT & fF 39 UdpR &1 PIs aRada 37yar IR Ha FT I fhar =m §, aF a8 00 ARE §
Sahr 3l v af & wa & A fheg ofg af g & TN IR s JER T TEH FA T
A § pH e @Ol fheq T oG dUA b @ Fholl F EfUsd fRAT SIRET R ST F & &
gem #, 0 3fafike sRaw @ Tdr 3af e af aF & gohel gfvsd frar S|

4. AT it AT 9RT 52 & TAE H Th a5 URT & gfaedaT — 3fAETe & [
URT 52 & TAF H T a8 97 gfaeaia & seh, g -

"52. AT & UfANUT & AT gus - S A 33U gRT Ay fr S, RAHT a1 Feat A
™ S fpa AR #F P @fere A a1 B RAerdT gee ar 3RATH A URT 90 & wWus
(9) & 3u@us (i) & gRT ufafig A% Frerl Af¥g & a1 ¥ &=a & F9Q, J9g & 399,
THR 3Uefd a1 g HIRA B FFAT & ar a6 -

(@) IE T Pcg & gRumeEEaRy R Afh A Acg FIRG &, d I §F a9 dF F
BRI 3R sda AT § [T I0A &8 @ T0A T @ bl gosd hdT ST Feha;

@) IR W P & uRvmETIRT Rl cafh @t ek susfa wIRaG @, O 9 g a¥ a®
& PRIETE 3R a9 JAA ¥ [FGH A Uia @ TuF b & Gohahh &fsa frar s aaham;

@n IR W Fcg & uRuneETay foRdr cafh & uRunfAe afa wika @, 0 wREE @
S ae 3afd a0 a¥ de & Hholl Td 3l S @ Taeh ThaA 2.50 o TUd deh & Fehall, &fvsd
RIT ST,

@ ¢ W Fcg & gRomATaey AT cafh @ w5 afa FIRG F & a T FREE J
fSadr 3afe a1d a¥ a& & Fhl AR saa A & T A Th ar@ IO dF & Fhah, Gfosd
RIT ST,

AR : FH URT & GASS FHR 3Usfd g @ dAreud a@l @em S AR gus dfed,
1860 &1 URT 320 H §I"

5. AT Hr arr 53 F @MUT - IRAAIA AT 9RT 53 F A FHE A FAE 3R g @t
TUY & TATT H HAA: Aeq FHE Teh a¥ AR T ar@ Tud gfdeaniid o Sian|



4 FRWUS ISl (IMTIROT) LEhAR, 6 AddR, 2015

6. AP Hr 9RT 54 F TAMuaT - 3fARTA A 9RT 54 F e TIHE U T WA & TUF H
UG HHE UTdiE TR 30 gfaeniid fhd Smaan|

7. AT & ATea arT 55 & TUF F T3 9T & g - fREgs & Ggea arr
55 & T # Aeafaf@d ag arr gfaeafia & eh, gar -

"55. U AT deoll H @A & forv gus fad da@g & 3y foear am & - S dis
fafREIT WP & e, 3Ua deat # AT BIS A TT S U, AT TAT FAUTE A &N HROT
WTd g @ 5 s8a 3, e, aRaea @ Rfaar Bl e s @ g3 & o1 '8 I=a v
1 0E A A #T BROT F|d g ZAW ARG S AL I e ¥, O 98 0 #REw @
S A ©: A ¥ s F gell fbheg S i aul T & dhalt 3R T A @ fSHdr e
UaTd TR ¥ & FA el @Ol Afhed Sif UHh ol TUY dd & Thll JUar AT & Hed & &a
IO IHA, S 3AF &, & FHd

8. FAFIH H arr 56 F AT - fRFTA Hr Fgaa arr 56 i UURT 1) F TE TR
T A TIE & TIA H UMT TR T Aeg Fafg IR 31fAETH Fr arr 56 &1 3049RT (2) # or &t
TUY Aeq HHPl & TUTHA H Teh gl T FHg UiAeAua fhd Siian|

9. IRFTT i RATAE T 57 F VT F G 9RT &1 ufaema - 3RAfAge & A9 9T 57 &
T # fAeafof@a a8 arr ufaeafa & sef, gar -

"57.  AJATTYURT A 3Fd Fad & HAUT poAl d fovw gus - (1) I 3@ 3REEH F
HAT & TS IFAY, URD AT UM BT Bl URD, SHPT Bl Tad AT 3TD 3N T BH AT o -

(@) T WER & ARG grr ok ved fredt et grr & ffd I @ s
YR P A, URE AT U T UFd B Geb; AT

(@) 9RT 89 IT 90 & 33T T T fRaY ATH FT JAAGSIA Seeded BY; U

@M D, IR A1 g A fRAT o /T & Ha A, TrEd o @ 3RfATH # 3T A
gz faftd a8 &, SAAGEIaN IS BH HY AT HIH X A b BY; dl dg (F) P &M A §F &R
T g AR (@) Tr @) f g H, el 3cuG Tod H A eI @, UUH IR & o, W@
ST &1 SR 29T, S 3cUTg Toted T @il Y ol ThA & hA A @ AT U o I S 36
g, dor G geigfa & ford 08 JA & gt @1 ST 3cuTg UEd Elfe T R JOm 8w o &
1 &8 oG ?ud S 31 & AR STel Scure Toied &1 &1l 3edaied o &1, W& Sf#AT & Rt gam
el T 8 TR ¥Ud @ & foheq U o Tud § 31MAH o B



SRYUS J1GIC (IHTYURTN) LhdR, 6 dAdFaR, 2015 S

(2) 3UYURT (1) & 3T TT b Pls IS Al [hAT JIRIN Fddd 6 IHFAd, WHAC I IRB
b URP Bl —

(@ ffaa g@ar & grT 38 59 9RT & AT 3 A A F YR g1 7 F199;

@ IR & g W a7 & AR, a1 & Afcw 7 [y e = @, giegs
e’ o g I

@D QA A GAATS F I S o fhar = @

10. HARIT fif 9RT 68 F TUEH H a8 URT & yfarAua - IRAFIH Hr RAIAT 9RT 68 &
T 7 RAfai@a a8 arr ufaeafa fr sref, gar -

“68. UL BT WA WA R ’Ror Aow gFula B Ad FA H AR - (F) 3D,
AT AT T AR gRT $Hb ToIw Afh Uad 3cule UGIAdRT S 3curg et &1 ufeh & A &
i

(®) URT 89 & WUs () & INT g fheel ATl grr 3RRNT fopelt ufdaeyr & areha
Td gU frdT i &, TEd g9, URe A1 U 9RT 42 F @S (F), (@) AT () F T
foafsa o1 AafFaa e o= Jg @, a1 e 39 AfRAfAgs & arT 49 3R 61 @ e frar
3T 9N & AT usdld R UUY & A @1 gihgh TU ¥ Hew fRAm Siar @, gurfeufd
fawfPsqd a1 Ada A & g 1 T IHUTY & UAAS TIeU, JAT ARG PAdH IhA & 3y,
wHA ITFHR AfAAATAZT & ol 10 (GH) &R TUY dh vd A1 TFHR fagfdaant & o Taa
Tored T aTfd uge @, UUH IR H g Usied & BT ar AU AT U A 39 S 3
Td fgT IR Seoea & aredfde Usied &1fd 1 IR 90T Td e o™ o0 it 3 &, TR
gohar| fRAATA o1 B9d & gaaE & I d TR IR Sedud I AWY & o Taw o i
& g & 39, RS vd o RAEsq ax & s

(@) Y oY Fera A, Gwed a5 meuf arr 66 3T 3fAWUT Aey FAEsh SR
AT 1 7S &N, USSR gRT ORT 67(1) & ded el UIRd fFY S & g dd et A &
I W S FHATEAT AT I/ 3cUIG USITUDRT gRI Ulerbiold Hed & 3% o &1, 38 HFU & Hafd
H HehaTl|

Weg e A 6 Sel 39 UaR IfATRIT & 75 Foufa, 38 3RATd & seewa d 3mafaq,
foefaa, wated ar fafafda & g afer &, o & Afexr w2 & TRl weg sa Avuee
39 dd & foear amen s e fafea foear s

(2) 9 IUYRT (1) & @WUs (F) A Sfeai@d TR &1 MY fhar S Iebr & df FAGD
s Ife g REa & @ af Rer e e e, 3 #fRRy & oea wfaRa & 8 el @
B &) gd wX & ARl 3R o afe ar 0l el & feg 3 FIS FRae aE b Al |



6 FR@US ISIc (AATYRYT) CERAR, 6 FAdFR, 2015

1. FfAAge fir 9rT 89 F wMUA - IRAATH H e arT 89 Fir IUURT (2) F WIS (n) F
IWIed @US (0) et YR & 3ia-TAa frar srwem, J2ar -

"R & & §AR TR b A UG T AH FHT B HUS &I, AGh el b
AT ta fh @ @R 3eed fAAueR, rade vd el & gefadl o fafadida
Ufaafd a TUT GeIr 3cute IRl gRT Y Al H b @ ufadfd e $r A uere
BT

12.  fRARATFE Hr arr 90 F TWUT - HAFTT A AT 9”T 90 i IUURT (7) F AT H
AFafaf@a st e, J2ar -

“gT, 3T Bl Yoo, Sl ToEd R’ Td Igard shrsdl & fAfAgAa F mays @ 3fRAAWT &=
gehat |

*kh*k

RW@US TIUTdl & A J,

o o FareEfd,
g gia-ae-Taf el
fafr (fauren) fasmr, s@vs, = |

TEIAT-TA0 ST0-36/2015-124/510 STRES e #Asel gRT I uid 3R IsIurel gry
f&eAieh 13 3eFgear, 2015 I HJAd FRES 3cuig (HAYA) AFAAIH, 2015 @1 fAeAilhd
U HgdIE SIRWS TSIUTT & ¥R ¥ SHb NI UHMAd fhar San & o8 AR
Gfaurd & 3geSe 348 & Ws (3) & A I HAAIH F IS wwr A widpa urs
HST ST |




SRYUS J1GIC (IHTYURTN) LhdR, 6 dAdFaR, 2015 7

THE JHARKHAND EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2015

(Jharkhand Act 15, 2015)

An act to amend the Jharkhand Excise Act, 1915 (Jharkhand Act Il of 1915) (hereinafter referred to as ‘the Act’) ;

Preamble —

as follows ;

Be it enacted by the legislature of the State of Jharkhand in the sixty sixth year of the republic of India

1. Short title, extent and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Jharkhand Excise (Amendment) Act,

2015

(2) It shall extend to the whole of the State of Jharkhand.

(3) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Substitution of a new section for section 47 of the Act.- For the existing section 47 of the Act, the following

new section shall be substituted, namely:-

“47. Penalty for unlawful Import, export, transport, manufacture, possession, consumption, sale etc.- If any

person, in contravention of, this Act, or any rule, notification or order made, or issued or given or license, permit

or pass granted under this Act-

imports, exports, transports, manufacture, possesses, consumes or sells any intoxicant; or

bottles any liquor for purpose of sale; or

establishes or works any distillery, manufactory, brewery or warehouse: or

uses, keeps or has in his possession any material, still, utensil, implement or apparatus whatsoever for
the purpose of manufacturing any intoxicant other than tari and pachwai for personal consumption; or
possesses any material or film with or without Government logo of any district, in the State or of any
other State or wrapper or any other thing in which intoxicant can be packed or any apparatus, or
implement or machine for the purpose of packing any intoxicant; or

removes any intoxicant from any distillery, brewery or warehouse, other place of storage licensed,
established, authorized or continued under this Act:

he shall be punished with imprisonment with a term which shall not be less then six months but which
may extend to five years and with fine which shall not be less than five thousand rupees but which
may extend to one lakh rupees and in default of payment of fine, he shall be punished with a further

imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year ;



8 FRWUS ISl (IMTIROT) LEhAR, 6 AddR, 2015

3. Substitution of a new section for the existing section 49 of the Act.- For the existing section 49 of the Act,

the following new section shall be substituted namely-

“49 Penalty for altering or attempting to alter any denatured spirit.- Whoever, alters or attempt to alter any
denatured spirit with the intention that such spirit may be used for human consumption, whether as a
beverage or internally as medicine, or in any other way, whatsoever, by any method whatsoever, or has in his
possession any spirit in respect of which he knows or has reason to believe that any such alteration or attempt
has been made, he shall be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than one year but
which may extend to five years and with fine which shall not be less then one lakh rupees but which may
extend to five lakh rupees and in default of payment of fine, he shall be punished with a further imprisonment

for a term which may extend to one year.”

4. Substitution of a new section for the existing section 52 of the Act.- The existing section 52 of the Act shall

be substituted by the following new section, namely-

“52. Penalty for adulteration of liqguor- Whoever mixes, or permits to be mixed, with any liquor sold,
manufactured or possessed by him any noxious drug or any foreign ingredient or any article prohibited by rule
made under section 90, clause (9), sub-clause (i) likely to cause disability, grievous hurt or death to human

beings, shall-

(@ if as a result of such an act, death is caused to any person, be punished with imprisonment
for a term which may extend to ten years and shall also be liable to fine which may extend
to ten lakh rupees.

(b) if as a result of such an act, grievous hurt is caused to any person, be punished with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to ten years, and shall also be liable to fine

which may extend to five lakh rupees.

(c) if as result of such an act, any other consequential injury is caused to a person, be
punished with imprisonment of either description for a term which may extend to ten
years and shall also be liable to fine which may extend to two lakhs fifty thousand.

rupees.

(d) if as a result of such an act no injury is caused to any person, be punished with
imprisonment of either description for a term which may extend to seven years and shall

also be liable to fine which may extend to one lakh rupees.



SRYUS ITSIC (ATIRYT) YhdR, 6 ddFeR, 2015 9

Explanation :- For the purpose of this section the expression “grievous hurt” shall have the same meaning as in
section 320 of the Indian Penal Code, 1860.

5. Amendment of section 53 of the Act.- In section 53 of the Act, for words “three months” and “five hundred

rupees”, words “one year” and “one lakh rupees”, respectively shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of Section 54 of the Act.- In section 54 of the Act, for the words “five hundred rupees” the words

“twenty five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

7. Substitution of a new section for the existing section 55 of the Act.- The existing section 55 of the Act shall be

substituted by the following new section, namely-

“b5. Penalty for possession of liquor in respect of which an offence has been committed.- Whoever, has in his
possession, any liquor, knowing or having reason to believe the same to have been unlawfully imported,
exported, transported, manufactured, or knowing or having reason to believe that the prescribed duty has not
been paid thereon, shall be punished with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months but
which may extend to three years and with fine which shall not be less then fifty thousand rupees but which

may extend to one lakh rupees or ten times of the value of liquor, whichever is higher.”

8. Amendment of section 56 of the Act.- For expression “one thousand rupees” appearing in sub-section (1) of
section 56 of the Act, the expression “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted and for the words “two
hundred rupees” appearing in sub-section (2) of section 56 of the said Act the words “one thousand rupees”

shall be substituted.

9. Substitution of a new section for the existing section 57 of the Act.- The existing section 57 of the Act shall be

substituted by the following new section, namely-

“57. Penalty for certain acts by licensee or his servant or person acting under him or on his behalf- (1) If any
holder of a license, permit or pass granted under this Act, or any person in his employ and acting under him

and on his behalf,-

(@) fails to produce such license, permit or pass on the demand of any officer empowered by the State
Government by notification to make such demand, or

(b) willfully contravenes any rule made under section 89 or section 90, or

(c) willfully does or omits to do anything in breach of the conditions of the license, permit or pass for which
no penalty is elsewhere provided in this Act,

he shall be liable in case (a), to fine which may extend to ten thousand rupees and in case (b) or in case (c),
where any loss of Excise revenue is involved in the first instance to penalty which shall not be less than
two times the loss of revenue or five lakh rupees whichever is higher and for the second subsequent



10 SRYUS ISl (HATYRUN) LhaR, 6 daFR, 2015
contravention to a penalty which shall not be less than four times the loss of excise revenue or ten lakh
rupees whichever is higher to be imposed by the licensing authority and where no loss of revenue is
involved to penalty which shall not be less than ten thousand rupees but which may extend to one lakh
rupees.
(2) No order shall be made under sub-section (1) unless the holder of the license, permit or pass is given-
(@) anotice in writing informing him of the grounds on which it is proposed to proceed under this section;
(b) a reasonable opportunity of making representation within such time as may be specified in the notice,
against such grounds; and,
(c) an opportunity to be heard in the matter.
10. Substitution of new section for section 68 of the Act.- For the existing section 68 of the Act, the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
“68. Power to compound offences and release properties liable to confiscation.-
(1) The Excise Commissioner, Collector or any Excise Officer empowered by the State Government in this

behalf, not below the rank of Superintendent of Excise-

@)

may subject to any restrictions imposed by any rule made under clause (i) of section 89 accept from any
person whose license, permit or pass is liable to be cancelled or suspended under clause (a), clause (b) or
clause (c) of section 42, or who is reasonably suspected of having committed an offence punishable under
any section of this Act other than 49 and section 61, payment of a sum of money upto ten thousand
rupees for less serious irregularities and for serious or major irregularities which has resulted in loss of
excise revenue, in the first instance two times the actual loss of excise revenue or five lakh rupees
whichever is higher, and in the case of second or subsequent contravention four times of actual loss of
revenue or ten lakh rupees whichever is higher, subject to such minimum as may be prescribed in lieu of
such cancellation or suspension or by way of composition of such offence or irregularity or defect as the
case may be. For the third offence or contravention of the provisions of the Act or rules made there under
which has resulted in loss of excise revenue, the license, permit or pass shall be cancelled.

in any case in which any property has been seized as being liable to confiscation under section 66, may, at
any time before the Magistrate has passed an order under section 67, sub-section (1) release the property
on payment of any sum not exceeding the value thereof as estimated by the Collector or the Excise
Officer.

Provided that when the property so seized is liquor manufactured, imported, exported or transported in

contravention of this Act, such liquor shall not be released but it shall be disposed of in such manner as may be

prescribed.



FREUS JTelC (IATYRYN) YhdR, 6 FdFaR, 2015 11

11.

12.

(2) When payments referred to in clause (a) of sub-section (1) have been duly made, the accused person, if in
custody shall be discharged, and the property seized (if any) other than liquor shall be released, and no further

proceedings shall be taken against such person or property.”

Amendment of section 89 of the Act- In the end of present sub section (2) clause (n) of section 89 of the Act,
the following clause shall be added as (0), namely “for endowing Panchayats at appropriate level and Gram
Sabha in Scheduled Area, the power of regulating and restricting, the licenses of, Exclusive Privilege, Distillery
and Breweries for manufacture and sale of intoxicants and restricting the sale of illicit liquor by licensee of a

retail liquor shop, in their respective areas”.

Amendment of section 90 of the Act.- In end of present sub-section (7) of section 90 of the Act, the

following shall be added, after sentence “or in respect of the storing of any intoxicant”,  namely :-

“Or may impose any other fee, whatsoever, which is necessary in the interest of revenue and

regulation of any licensed unit, running according to the provisions of this act.”

FRWUS JIqUTd & AL b,

0 A0 Frerafd,
g gia-ae-Taf el
fafr (fauren) fasmr, s@vs, = |

SIRYUS Jlelc (HTYROT)791—-50 |




